
Rhône Style Red Wine Blend
 ‘Jetty’ № 2019
About Jetty :  Jetty is a powerful blend of red grape varieties inspired 
by the Rhône region in France. Grenache and Syrah are the main 
grape varieties used, with Grenache providing a full-bodied richness 
bursting with fruity flavors of strawberry, raspberry, and cherry, as 
well as a spicy kick and elevated alcohol content. Syrah adds to the 
wine's power with its dark fruit flavors of blackberry and blueberry, 
complemented by savory notes of black pepper and smoked meat, 
and contributing tannins, color, and body to the blend.

In addition to Grenache and Syrah, our 2019 vintage of Jetty also 
features Cinsaut and Carignan. Cinsaut adds a bright and lively 
flavor profile with notes of red fruit, florals, and spice, contributing a 
lighter body and lower tannins to balance the blend. Carignan is 
renowned for its high acidity and tannins, contributing to the wine's 
structure and balance, along with a deeper color and pronounced 
tannins.

Our 2019 Jetty blend is composed of 60% Grenache, 20% Syrah, 10% 
Carignan, and 5% Cinsaut, resulting in a well-rounded and balanced 
flavor profile.

Tasting Notes : Jetty boasts a deep ruby color with aromatic notes 
of ripe blackberry, raspberry, and cherry, and hints of black pepper 
and smoked meat. On the palate, the wine is bold and full-bodied, 
with flavors of dark fruit, spice, and a pronounced tannin structure. 
Grenache contributes a richness and elevated alcohol content, 
while Syrah o�ers depth and body. Cinsaut and Carignan add lively 
flavors and balance to the blend, resulting in a well-rounded and 
harmonious wine.

ABV : 14.7%

AVA : Central Coast

Total Production : 330 cases


